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4158. WORKSHEET K-1 – HOSPICE COMPENSATION ANALYSIS SALARIES AND 

WAGES 
 
Enter all salaries and wages for the hospice on this worksheet for the actual work performed within 
the specific area or cost center in accordance with the column headings.  For example, if the 
administrator also performs visiting services which account for 55 percent of that person's time, 
then enter 45 percent of the administrator's salary on line 6 (A&G) and 55 percent of the 
administrator's salary enter on line 10 (Nursing Care). 
 
The records necessary to determine the split in salary between two or more cost centers must be 
maintained by the hospice and must adequately substantiate the method used to split the salary.  
These records must be available for audit by the contractor, and the contractor can accept or reject 
the method used to determine the split in salary.  When approval of a method has been requested 
in writing and this approval has been received prior to the beginning of a cost reporting period, the 
approved method remains in effect for the requested period and all subsequent periods until you 
request in writing to change to another method or until the contractor determines that the method 
is no longer valid due to changes in your operations. 
 
Definitions 
 
Salary.--This is gross salary paid to the employee before taxes and other items are withheld, 
including deferred compensation, overtime, incentive pay, and bonuses.  (See CMS Pub. 15-1, 
Chapter 21.) 
 
Administrator (Column 1).-- 
 
Possible Titles: President, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
Duties: This position is the highest occupational level in the agency.  This individual is the chief 
management official in the agency.  The administrator develops and guides the organization by 
taking responsibility for planning, organizing, implementing, and evaluating operations.  The 
administrator is responsible for the application and implementation of established policies.  The 
administrator may act as a liaison among the governing body, the medical staff, and any 
departments.  The administrator provides for personnel policies and practices that adequately 
support sound patient care and maintains accurate and complete personnel records.  The 
administrator implements the control and effective utilization of the physical and financial 
resources of the provider. 
 
Director (Column 2).-- 
 
Possible Titles: Medical Director, Director of Nursing, or Executive Director. 
 
Duties: The medical director is responsible for helping to establish and assure that the quality of 
medical care is appraised and maintained.  This individual advises the chief executive officer on 
medical and administrative problems and investigates and studies new developments in medical 
practices and techniques. 
 
The nursing director is responsible for establishing the objectives for the department of nursing.  
This individual administers the department of nursing and directs and delegates management of 
professional and ancillary nursing personnel. 
 
Medical Social Worker (Column 3).--  These services must be provided under the direction of a 
physician by a social worker who meets the requirements set forth in 42 CFR 418.114(b)(3). 
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Supervisors (Column 4).--Employees in this classification are primarily involved in the direction, 
supervision, and coordination of the hospice activities. 
 
When a supervisor performs two or more functions, e.g., supervision of nurses and home health 
aides, the salaries and wages must be split in proportion with the percentage of the supervisor's 
time spent in each cost center, provided the hospice maintains the proper records (continuous time 
records) to support the split.  If continuous time records are not maintained by the hospice, enter 
the entire salary of the supervisor on line 6 (A&G) and allocate to all cost centers through step-
down. However, if the supervisor's salary is all lumped in one cost center, e.g., nursing care, and 
the supervisor's title coincides with this cost center, e.g., nursing supervisor, no adjustment is 
required. 
 
Total Therapists (Column 6).--Include in column 6, on the line indicated, the cost attributable to 
the following services: 
 

 Physical therapy   - line 12 
 Occupational therapy  - line 13 
 Speech pathology   - line 14 

 
Therapy and speech-language pathology may be provided to control symptoms or to enable the 
individual to maintain activities of daily living and basic functional skill. 
 
Physical therapy is the provision of physical or corrective treatment of bodily or mental conditions 
by the use of physical, chemical, and other properties of heat, light, water, electricity, sound, 
massage, and therapeutic exercise by or under the direction of a registered physical therapist as 
prescribed by a physician. 
 
Occupational therapy is the application of purposeful, goal-oriented activity in the evaluation, 
diagnosis, and/or treatment of persons whose ability to work is impaired by physical illness or 
injury, emotional disorder, congenital or developmental disability, or the aging process, in order 
to achieve optimum functioning, to prevent disability, and to maintain health. 
 
Speech-language pathology is the provision of services to persons with impaired functional 
communications skills by or under the direction of a qualified speech-language pathologist as 
prescribed by a physician.  This includes the evaluation and management of any existing disorders 
of the communication process centering entirely, or in part, on the reception and production of 
speech and language related to organic and/or nonorganic factors. 
 
Aides (Column 7).--Included in this classification are specially trained personnel employed for 
providing personal care services to patients.  These employees are subject to Federal wage and 
hour laws.  This function is performed by specially trained personnel who assist individuals in 
carrying out physician instructions and established plans of care.  The reason for the home health 
aide services must be to provide hands-on personal care services under the supervision of a 
registered professional nurse. 
 
Aides may provide personal care services and household services to maintain a safe and sanitary 
environment in areas of the home used by the patient, such as changing the bed or light cleaning 
and laundering essential to the comfort and cleanliness of the patient. Additional services include, 
but are not limited to, assisting the patient with activities of daily living. 
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All Other (Column 8). -- Employees in this classification are those not included in columns 1 - 7. 
Included in this classification are dietary, spiritual, and other counselors.  Counseling Services 
must be available to both the terminally ill individual and the family members or other persons 
caring for the individual at home. Counseling, including dietary counseling, may be provided both 
for the purpose of training the individual's family or other care giver to provide care, and for the 
purpose of helping the individual and those caring for him or her to adjust to the individual's 
approaching death. This includes dietary, spiritual and other counseling services provided while 
the individual is enrolled in the hospice. 
 
Total (Column 9).--Add the amounts of each cost center, columns 1 through 8, and enter the total 
in column 9.  Transfer these totals to Worksheet K, column 1, lines as applicable.  To facilitate 
transferring amounts from Worksheet K-1 to Worksheet K, the same cost centers with 
corresponding line numbers are listed on both worksheets.  Not all of the cost centers are applicable 
to all agencies. Therefore, use only those cost centers applicable to your hospice. 
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